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Introduction 
 
Traditional retirement plans are often designed to 
get people from point A to point B. However, as 
you begin to sketch out this seemingly 
straightforward journey, it’s easy to forget that, like 
the first explorers, there are sections of every map 
that are uncharted, with boundaries outside of 
what can be seen, explained, or anticipated. 
 
It’s not uncommon to overlook these voids and 
simply assume they will remain outside the 
mapped area. Yet, instead of considering the 
unknown as off limits or out of the picture, I want to 
encourage you to embrace and explore them. To 
walk off the path in order to survey the depths of 
your heart and soul, seeking out those distant 
places, and expanding the retirement horizon 
instead of putting boundaries around it. 
 
Approaching retirement planning as a voyage that 
embraces both the known and the unknown leads 
to very different conversations and results. The 
discussions will be more fun, creative, and 
personal, and they’ll be more meaningful.  
 
Despite the many freedoms that retirement is 
supposed to offer you, venturing off a traditional 
planning path isn’t part of the playbook for many 
people.  As a result, they can be apprehensive 
about discussing these new frontiers and putting 
their thoughts and ideas on paper. People assume 
if they have the right amount of money and reach a 
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certain age, everything will just work out.  They 
have been medicated to believe that retirement is 
all about the dollars and cents, and that they’ll 
figure it out when they get there.   
 
But nothing in life comes that easy. Too often, 
vague or general assumptions about what life in 
retirement may be like can lead to disappointment, 
frustration, and learning things the hard way later.  
Yet, retirement doesn’t need to be a strange place 
where we end up, full of excuses as to why so 
much of life ended up in the background, out of 
sight and off the map.  
 
Instead consider this book like a new prescription 
or vaccine for retirement. Just as a physician 
injects a small dose of a germ into our body so that 
we can develop a natural defense against it, 
retirees must be given a small dose of what it is 
going to be like to retire in order to defeat 
unrealistic expectations and reduce reality shock 
once they get there.      
 
This new retirement treatment requires more than 
a single dose and must be accompanied by a 
commitment to invest as much time and energy in 
yourself as you have with the financial aspects of 
retirement. It means starting to infuse your life with 
new steps and actions—because great personal 
stories and family legacies aren’t created by 
following the same plan as everyone else. Instead, 
they are blazed by going where there is no path 
and leaving a trail for others to follow.  
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On the following pages, you will find small doses of 
wisdom, inspiration and truth.  Don’t feel confined 
to following the normal page order or my editor’s 
preference for guided structure.  Meander through 
the material at your own pace, taking time to stop 
and enjoy this new lease on life in retirement.  Get 
the most out of your experience by journaling your 
new discoveries and inspiring others by sharing 
your findings with us and those around you.  
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Fishing For The Big Ones 
 
Gary was an avid fisherman and found his way into 
the bait and tackle aisle of every store he could.  
During one trip he noticed a young boy about 10 
years old standing alone by the lures.  
 
He was pleased to see the young man taking an 
interest in the more advanced stuff, instead of just 
assuming that worms and a bobber were the only 
way to go. So, he struck up a conversation with the 
young angler by asking, “See anything good over 
here?”  
 
The young man turned to him with a somewhat 
serious look and replied, “Not really, the purple 
worms and a frog work best for me.”  
 
That’s when Gary caught a glimpse of the giant 
frog lure the kid had in his hands. It not only 
covered his entire palm but looked big enough to 
be showcased at a county fair.   
 
The sheer size of the frog and the boy’s sincere 
answer caught Gary off guard, causing him to 
laugh aloud and say, “Wow, that’s a pretty big frog 
isn’t it?”  
 
Gary wasn’t trying to be condescending or to make 
the young kid feel like he was out of his league and 
should change his selection, but it just seemed so 
ridiculous to Gary. 
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That’s why Gary was surprised when the boy 
turned to him and without hesitation said, “Not if 
you're trying to catch the big ones!” 
 
The kid tipped his ball cap at Gary and left him 
standing in the aisle dumbfounded, but with a 
valuable lesson: Don’t be afraid to go for the big 
one, no matter what other, more experienced 
people think! 
 
In other words, don’t let mainstream ideas or 
perceptions about retirement dictate what you 
should do in this next phase of life.  Go big and 
don’t be afraid to challenge the status quo. It’s an 
invigorating attitude to carry in life. 
 
 
What aspects of your retirement life and plan are 
you going for the big one with?  What do you feel 
lured to accomplish in retirement?   
 
How have you gone against the grain in the past or 
challenged the status quo?   
 
What pre-conceived notions or limitations have you 
had to rise above?   
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A Bittersweet Transition 
 
Larry is a respected financial planner who is 
occasionally called upon to serve as an expert 
financial witness in divorce cases—primarily, when 
one spouse tries to hide assets in order to avoid 
splitting them.  
 
In one case, Larry was called into the court room 
and asked to take the stand. In most court 
proceedings, the attorney who hired him has to 
prove that he’s an authority in his field of expertise. 
Therefore, he has to read off all of Larry’s 
impressive credentials, experience, and career 
accolades.    
 
As the attorney meandered through the 
disclosures, Larry sat on the right hand side of the 
judge patiently waiting to testify when out of the 
blue, the defendant (ex-husband) broke court 
protocol. He blurted out, “Okay, there is no way I 
know as much as this financial guy and, yes, there 
was money in the account that I did not include 
during the divorce proceedings.” 
 
The judge immediately called the attorney and ex-
husband to the bench. The judge advised they 
adjourn the proceeding and that the two men 
should meet in the hallway to reach a settlement, 
which they did.   
 
Larry was dismissed and as he walked out of the 
courtroom, the attorney and defendant graciously 
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thanked him.  Larry smiled and was glad to be part 
of the winning team but the entire situation ended 
up being bittersweet.  On the one hand, he didn’t 
have to say a word—no testimony, cross 
examination, or submission of court exhibits. 
Nothing.  
 
On the other hand, he had spent hours preparing 
for that moment, including hours of reviewing 
relevant forms and statements, researching 
historical prices for a variety of stocks, and then 
summarizing it all into several documents. He was 
paid handsomely for all his time and effort, yet the 
case resolved so unexpectedly, it left him feeling 
somewhat unfulfilled.  
 
At first, Larry joked with family and friends about 
how easy it was to make that money. But there 
was something else he wasn’t talking about. He 
actually wanted to testify. He wanted to share the 
work he did, how he did it, have the court 
recognize his expertise, and convey to both 
plaintiff and defendant his determination to get to 
the bottom of this situation.  
 
To make matters more confusing, a week before 
this case was tried, Larry was complaining to his 
wife about the workload, how it took longer than 
expected, and that he probably should have turned 
down the case.  
 
Was Larry happy, mad, or sad?  Frankly, he 
actually felt all of them and was experiencing 
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something called competing feelings. It is very 
common and shouldn’t be dismissed, especially 
when you get closer and closer to retirement. 
 
As people make their way to and through 
retirement, they can experience a wide variety of 
feelings, which sometimes don’t seem to make 
sense. Some retirees may have complained about 
their job in the past, but miss it when they retire. 
Others may have plenty of money saved and 
invested, but miss the buzz of problem solving, or 
being part of a team environment.  And yet, many 
of these same retirees can find joy in their 
newfound freedom to wake up without an alarm 
clock.   
 
In any case, you’re not alone in feeling bittersweet 
about retirement. Which makes it important to 
avoid glossing over your thoughts and feelings, 
and spending hours trying to solve emotional 
problems that may take time to sort out and work 
through.   
 
 
What are the different feelings you have had or are 
having about retirement?  
 
What are the things that excite you and those that 
concern or worry you? 
 
Write down two people that you can contact for 
advice about what it takes to adapt to retirement.  
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Certified Professional Retirement Coach 
Certification (CPRC) 

 
Now more than ever, advisors must realize that 
there is more to retirement that just the dollars and 
cents. Fact is, people are failing at retirement at an 
alarming rate because they aren’t prepared for the 
non-financial aspects of it.  Use our certification to: 
 

• Protect and grow your business by making 
deeper, more emotional connections with 
clients  
 

• Use non-financial topics and conversations 
to generate new business like never before 

 

• Gain a competitive advantage that will 
magnify your influence and establish you as 
a go-to expert 

 

• Find new value in your role by coaching 
clients on retirement topics that they want 
and need, but don’t know who to turn to 

 

• Be more referable because of the impact you 
are having on others 

 
The Certified Professional Retirement Coach™ 
designation is an accepted CE provider for CFP®, 
IMCA, ICF, SHRM and is listed at FINRA.org   
 
1st module is Free at CertifiedRetirementCoach.org 

 

Plus Save $500 with coupon code CPRCSAVE  
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Inspire, Educate, & Engage With Retirement Rx 
 
Make Retirement Rx available to clients, 
employees, and organization members as the ideal 
way to help them start talking about and planning 
for the non-financial aspects of retirement. 
 
Bulk orders save money as well as build trust and 
confidence.   
 
Physical copies of the book send a clear message 
that you are concerned and interested in helping 
people make a successful transition from work-life 
to home life…. And that retirement isn’t just about 
the dollars and cents.  
 
Retirement Rx  

• Differentiates you and your organization 
 

• Says that you care about them 
 

• Positions you as a wellness advocate 
 

• Offers real life ideas and applications 
 

• Helps make an impact in others lives  
 

• Enhances your professional legacy 
 
 
Bulk pricing starts at just $8 per book for as little as 
25 copies.  Orders can be completed online at 
RetirementRx.org or by calling 888-267-1138. 
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                         changing the way people think  
                         about and prepare for every  
                         aspect of retirement. His nationally  
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status quo of traditional planning.  
 

As a former social worker and certified personal 
trainer turned money manager, author, and 
retirement coach he has found that retirement is 
among the most fascinating, yet least understood, 
phases of life.  
 

Robert founded RetirementProject.org and the 
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speaking and teaching economic, investment, and 
coach training programs for over 15 years.  
 

He is married to his amazing wife Amie, and 
together they have a blended family with four 
children: Connor, Ava, Lucas, and Drake.   
 

You can learn more at RetirementProject.org 
 

72 

 



 

 

 

 


